

BID ABSTRACT
BID NO. 015-2013 - Collision REBID
Bid Opening: June 26, 2013- 11am
 Prepared By: K. Sullivan, Purchasing Mgr.

		A. Lembo Car and Truck Collision, Inc.	Livingston Collision, Inc.	Northfield Collision	MAACO Auto Painting
		76 Riverside Ave. Newark, NJ 07104	521 Mount Pleasant Ave. Livingston, NJ 07039	16 East Northfield Road Livingston, NJ 07039	46 Central Ave. Orange, NJ 07050
ITEM	DESCRIPTION	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
A	Automobile, light truck and van repairs (up to 9,200 GVW)				
	Parts- % Discount	-20.00%	\$0.00		10.00%
	Body labor / per hour	\$20.00	\$55.00	\$48.00	\$40.00
	Paint labor / per hour	\$20.00	\$55.00	\$48.00	\$20.00
	Mechanical Labor / per hour	\$20.00	\$75.00	\$50.00	\$50.00
	Average hourly rate	\$20.00	\$61.67	\$48.67	\$36.67
B	Medium duty truck and bus repairs (9,201-17,500 GVW)				
	Parts- % Discount	-20.00%	\$0.00		No Bid
	Body labor / per hour	\$25.00	\$75.00	\$50.00	No Bid
	Paint labor / per hour	\$25.00	\$75.00	\$50.00	No Bid
	Mechanical Labor / per hour	\$25.00	\$75.00	\$55.00	No Bid
	Average hourly rate	\$25.00	\$75.00	\$51.67	
C	Heavy duty trucks and bus (17,501 GVW and over)				
	Parts- % Discount	-20.00%	\$0.00		No Bid
	Body labor / per hour	\$30.00	\$75.00	\$75.00	No Bid
	Paint labor / per hour	\$30.00	\$75.00	\$75.00	No Bid
	Mechanical Labor / per hour	\$30.00	\$75.00	\$85.00	No Bid
	Average hourly rate	\$30.00	\$75.00	\$78.33	